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GOAL 
 

School subjects 
and  

related objectives 
 

 
Full description of activities 

 
Resources 

and 
materials 

 
Methodology 

 
Timing 

Assessment 
against 

objectives: 
(how does the 
childrens’work 
or activity meet 
the objectives?) 

 
Observing a 

different work 
environment in 
which we can 

discover pleasant 
aspects of the florist 

profession. 
 

 
1.​ ​Visit: 

"At the florist" 
 

 
Each child will come with a parent to the         
flower shop we will visit. After the arrival        
of all the children, the staff of the florist         
will present us the way of arranging the        
space, the different types of flowers that       
can be found in the florist, the care of the          
flowers, the way of creating a bouquet of        
flowers. They will explain to students why       
flowers have different prices, as well as       
other information about flowers. 

 
Flowers, 
floral 
arrangements 
special 
decorations 
for 
arrangements 
 

 
Conversation, 
observation, 
demonstration
. 
 

 
 ​20 min 

 

 
Developing 
socialization 

capacity. 
Discovering the 

satisfaction of being 

 
2. Role play:  

"Flower sellers" 
 

 
After watching the flower sale, the kids       
will act as sellers, trying to attract       
customers and learn to value the money.       
They will then practice how to work with        
money, either as sellers or as buyers, and        
will develop their ability to socialize with       

 
Flowers, 
money. 
 

 
Demonstratio
n, exercise, 
conversation. 

 
20 min 
 

 

 
 



rewarded for the 
work done. 

 

known and unknown people. They will      
understand that well-done work is     
ultimately rewarded. 

 
Fixing new 

knowledge gained. 

 
3. Aesthetic and 

creative area: 
"Favorite bouquet" 

 
After the activity in the florist, we will 
return to the classroom, where we will 
represent the flowers with the help of the 
painting, and the works will be exposed in 
order to be bought. Each child will set the 
price for his own work. 

 
Sheets of  
paper, 
watercolors, 
brushes, 
sponges, 
expozition 
board. 
 

 
Conversation, 
exercise, role 
play. 

 
45 min 

 

 

 

 
 


